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Jump to Section: Darksiders II is
the third game in the series

developed by Vigil Games, and
released on August 7, 2010. The

game, like the previous two in the
series, takes place in a fictional

world where there are many
different realms and themes. The
first game in the series featured

the player taking the role of
Death, whose goal was to execute

justice on gods who had been
murdering mortals. In this game,
the player takes the role of the
"Chosen One", a warrior who
"avenges the death of thirt
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beautiful beings by fending off
invading forces and engaging in

battle with The game was
released on DVD and as a

DVD/Blu-ray set, and also had a
PC, PS3, and Xbox 360 release.

The Xbox 360 release, like the PC
release, had a download code

included. Darksiders II was
released in Japan in late February
2011. The English version of the

game has been released in Japan,
North America, Europe,

Australasia, and all territories of
PAL. The release occurred on May
4, 2011 on Xbox 360 and PC, and

May 5, 2011 on PS3. Overview
The game starts with the player in
the Sacred Land, which is Earth,

and the player has just been
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resurrected by Fury, the Goddess
of Fear, with a new weapon. Using
this weapon, the player then must
head north to the Hyperion Ruins,

a land where the player must
fight the Seven Deadly Sins,

otherwise known as the Seven
Deadly Plagues, before they can
attack Earth. In the Sacred Land,

the player must travel to the
Gates of Pandemonium, where he
must fight the three Titans, who
are the Devourer of Souls, the
King of Lies, and the Spawn of

Hell. From there, the player must
travel to Valhalla and Van

Helsing's Den to fight the Demon
Lord, before returning to Earth.

Plot Prior to the game's start, the
player was killed by a demon. As
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the demon was about to break his
neck, he heard a voice. Before he

could finish talking, the player
was revived by Fury, the Goddess
of Fear, who informed him of the

demon's plans, and that the
player was to help destroy him.

She also gave him a new weapon,
the Scythe of Celestial Justice.

The player then must travel to the
Hyperion Ruins, where the player
must fight The Seven Deadly Sins,

otherwise known as the Seven
Deadly Plagues. These plagues

are bound and
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